

Niagara Public Purchasing Committee Tender
Tender Summary - RFT-MW-OPS-26-10 - Supply & Delivery of Asphalt Products
This Price Summary is not an indication of Selected Bidder(s)

	GIP Paving Inc.	Rankin Construction	Lakeside Landscape	Walker Aggregates	Black Armour Asphalt	Innovative Surface
Section A: Bituminous Patching Material per Tonne						
HL2	\$120.00	\$110.17	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
HL3	\$95.00	\$83.52	NO BID	\$95.59	NO BID	NO BID
HL3F	\$101.00	\$94.67	NO BID	\$105.55	NO BID	NO BID
HL3HS	\$101.00	\$91.97	NO BID	\$98.95	NO BID	NO BID
HL8	\$92.00	\$80.70	NO BID	\$93.59	NO BID	NO BID
HL8HS	\$97.00	\$90.56	NO BID	\$97.96	NO BID	NO BID
HM3	\$120.00	\$108.25	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Sheet Top	\$129.00	\$110.17	NO BID	\$125.24	NO BID	NO BID
Del/Tonne for Section A	\$18.50	N/A	NO BID	N/A	NO BID	NO BID
Environmental Charge For Section A	\$2.25	\$2.50	NO BID	\$2.00	NO BID	NO BID
Winter Heating	\$5.00	\$3.40	NO BID	\$3.00	NO BID	NO BID
Time when Winter Heating Applies	St. Cath & Nebo - Nov 1 - Dec 18 Hamilton Jan 3-Apr 13 \$40/tonne	Nov. 1 - Dec 18	NO BID	Nov 1 - Dec 18	NO BID	NO BID
Plant Open Dates (1) - Section A	April 13 - Dec 18	April 27 - Dec 18	NO BID	April 13 - Dec 18	NO BID	NO BID
Plant Open Dates (2) - Section A	Jan 3 - Apr 13	n/a	NO BID	April 27 - Dec 4	NO BID	NO BID
Plant Open Dates (3) - Section A	Apr 13 - Dec 18	n/a	NO BID	n/a	NO BID	NO BID
Section B: Emulsified Asphalt Patching Materials						
Premium QPR, I.A.R, or equivalent Per Tonne	\$170.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$185.00	\$140.00	\$125.00
Standard E.H.P, or equivalent Per Tonne	\$170.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$185.00	NO BID	NO BID
HPA QPR	\$170.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Pro Patch Cold Mix or equivalent Per Tonne	\$170.00	NO BID	\$235.00	\$185.00	\$140.00	\$125.00
Delivery by Tandem Axle Truck for Section B - Emulsified Asphalt Patching Material Per Tonne	\$18.50	NO BID	\$7.50	\$0.00	\$26.50	\$25.00
Environmental Charge For Section B	\$2.25	NO BID	\$0.00	\$2.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
Plant Open Dates (1) - Section B	April 12 - April 12	NO BID	All Year	April 13 - Dec 18	All Year	All Year
Plant Open Dates (2) - Section B	n/a	NO BID	n/a	April 27 - Dec 4	n/a	All Year
Plant Location (1)	28 Neilson Ave, St. Catharines	3299 Thorold Townline Rd, Thorold	1799 Allanport Rd, Thorold	2800 Thorold Townline Rd, Niagara Falls	1735 Highway 24, North Dumfries	3000 Ament Line, Heidelberg
Plant Location (2)	501 Main St. E Hamilton	n/a		3614 Fly Rd, Lincoln		3444 Brock Rd. N Uxbridge
Plant Location (3)	669 Nebo Road Hannon	n/a				