Niagara Public Purchasing Committee Tender
Tender Summary - RFT-MW-OPS-25-13 - Supply & Delivery of Granular Materials
This Price Summary is not an indication of Selected Bidder(s)

Waterford Sand & | Port Colborne Quarries Walker Aggregates Inc.
Gravel Inc.
i . . Plant 1 Plant 1 Plant 1 Plant 2 Plant 3 Plant 4
Section A Definition and Specifications
Unit Price Per Tonne | Unit Price Per Tonne | Unit Price Per Tonne | Unit Price Per Tonne | Unit Price Per Tonne | Unit Price Per Tonne
1 3/4" Clear Stone $20.75 $19.86 $27.50 $22.45 $32.60 $22.50
2 3/4" Traffic Bond Granular Class "A" $13.75 $13.90 $16.80 $14.35 $20.80 $15.30
3 3/8" Granular Class "A" $14.25 $14.11 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 Granular Class "B" $13.75 $13.69 $16.80 $14.35 $20.80 $15.30
5 5/8" Traffic Bond Granular Class "M" $14.25 $14.11 NO BID $14.65 NO BID $15.80
6 1/2" Traffic Bond $14.25 $14.11 NO BID $14.65 NO BID NO BID
7 Limestone Screenings $15.50 $15.15 NO BID $13.25 $17.25 NO BID
8 100mm - 200mm Gabion Stone $29.65 $25.86 $28.90 $28.90 NO BID NO BID
9 200mm - 400mm Rip Rap $40.40 $28.22 $28.90 $28.90 NO BID NO BID
10 1/4-3/8" Washed Stone $19.75 $19.86 $21.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID
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Gravel Inc.
Section B |Delivery Location Plant 1 Plant 1 Plant 1 Plant 2 Plant 3 Plant 4
1 City of Niagara Falls - Zone 1 Price Per Tonne $7.75 $8.00 $8.10 NO BID $6.00 $7.80
Minimum Order for Delivery (Tonnes) 35 20 22 22 22
2 City of Niagara Falls - Zone 2 Price Per Tonne $7.25 $7.75 $9.05 NO BID $7.70 $7.60
Minimum Order for Delivery (Tonnes) 35 20 22 22 22
3 City of St. Catharines $9.50 $8.00 $6.40 $6.65 $6.00 NO BID
Minimum Order for Delivery (Tonnes) 20 20 22 22 22
4 City of Welland $5.25 $5.50 $9.05 $9.10 NO BID $10.00
Minimum Order for Delivery (Tonnes) 20 20 22 22 22
5 Town of Fort Erie $7.75 $8.00 $12.10 NO BID NO BID $5.10
Minimum Order for Delivery (Tonnes) 20 20 22 22
6 Niagara Parks Commission $7.00 $8.00 $11.10 NO BID NO BID $7.50
Minimum Order for Delivery (Tonnes) 35 20 22 22
7 Regional Municipality of Niagara $10.00 $9.00 $13.00 $13.00 NO BID $13.00
Minimum Order for Delivery (Tonnes) 20 20 22 22 22
Location of Quarry 10546 Hwy 3, Wainfleet| 1027 Rgg?;gf?:" Port | 3614 Fiy Rd. Lincoln 5502;;’#3%5 St 28(,)Qod_T,Z?:gjfr; EZ{?!”E e RFig?-teg?; me
Section C |Other Plant 1 Plant 1 Plant 1 Plant 2 Plant 3 Plant 4
1 c[))jt”s\i/ggyo(f:rs]ae';?tzgf;Eglci:(;?it:r?g to other locations in Niagara Available upon request $10.00 Available upon request | Available upon request | Available upon request | Available upon request
2 Environmental Fee - per Tonne $1.90 $1.50 $2.00 $2.00 $2.00 $2.00
1. Ministry of Natural Resources Fee to be included in the above
3 unit prices per Tonne Fee to be stated separately on invoices:
$0.243 $0.243 $0.243 $0.243 $0.243 $0.243

2. Only increase in above prices accepted will be due to Ministry
of Natural Resources fee increase (if any)

Note: MNR Fee Per Tonne (included in price per tonne)
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