
Innovative Surface 
Solutions Brennan Paving Walker Aggregates Rankin Construction Lakeside Landscape GIP Paving Inc. Black Armour 

Asphalt Products

HL2 No Bid No Bid No Bid $104.00 No Bid $115.00 No Bid
HL3 No Bid $95.00 $91.60 $79.00 No Bid $90.00 No Bid
HL3F No Bid $103.00 $104.33 $85.00 No Bid $95.00 No Bid
HL3HS No Bid $107.00 $95.54 $87.00 No Bid $95.00 No Bid
HL8 No Bid $87.00 $89.60 $76.00 No Bid $87.00 No Bid
HL8HS No Bid $106.00 $94.37 $86.00 No Bid $92.00 No Bid
HM3 No Bid $103.00 $121.09 $104.00 No Bid $115.00 No Bid
Sheet Top No Bid No Bid $127.84 $108.00 No Bid $120.00 No Bid
Del/Tonne for Section A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Environmental Charge 
For Section A N/A $1.00 $1.75 $4.00 N/A $2.25 N/A

Winter Heating N/A $2.00 $3.00 $5.00 N/A $5.00 N/A

Time when Winter 
Heating Applies N/A Nov. 1 - Dec. 15 Nov. 1 - Dec. 31 Nov. 1 - Dec. 20 N/A

Plant 1 - Nov. 1 - Dec. 
20 ($5.00)

Plant 2 - Feb. 1 - Apr. 
30 ($40.00)

N/A

Asphalt Emulsion CRS-1 
Per Litre No Bid No Bid $3.05 No Bid No Bid $3.25 No Bid

Premium QPR, I.A.R, or 
equivalent Per Tonne $120.00 No Bid $175.00 No Bid No Bid $155.00 $165.50

Standard E.H.P, or 
equivalent  Per Tonne No Bid No Bid $175.00 No Bid No Bid $155.00 No Bid

Pro Patch Cold Mix or 
equivalent Per Tonne $120.00 No Bid $175.00 No Bid $227.25 $155.00 $165.50

Delivery by Tandem Axle 
Truck for Section C - 
Emulsified Asphalt 
Patching Material Per 
Tonne

$20.00 N/A

$20.00 Based on full 
load delivery, half 

load/minimum 
delivery charges will 

apply

N/A N/A $18.50
Delivery Fee is 

included in the unit 
price

Environmental Charge 
For Section C No Charge N/A $1.75 N/A N/A $2.25

Delivery Fee is 
included in the unit 

price

Plant Open Dates - 
Section A & B N/A May 1 - Dec. 15

 Plant 1 - Apr. 15 - 
Dec. 20

Plant 2 - Apr. 22 - 
Nov. 29 

Apr. 8 - Dec. 20 N/A Apr. 15 - Dec. 20 N/A

Plant Open Dates -  
Section C All Year N/A All Year N/A All Year Feb. 1 - Dec. 20 All Year

Plant Location (1) Heidelberg Port Colborne/ 
Wainfleet Niagara Falls Thorold Thorold St. Catharines Beamsville

Plant Location (2) Uxbridge Lincoln Hamilton Cambridge

This Price Summary is not an indication of Selected Bidder(s)

Niagara Public Purchasing Committee Tender

Section A: Bituminous Patching Material per Tonne

Section B: Asphalt Emulsion CRSI

Section C:  Emulsified Asphalt Patching Materials

Tender Summary - RFT14-2024 - Supply & Delivery of Asphalt Products
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